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The present research examines the influence of organizational
justice (distributive justice and procedural justice) on predicting job
performance (task performance and contextual performance). Sur-
vey data were drawn from a sample of 136 customer-contact employ-
ees within the telecommunications industry in Malaysia. Results of
the regression analysis illustrate that distributive justice alone has
a significant and positive relationship with task performance. On the
other hand, only procedural justice is found to be significantly and
positively related to contextual performance. Implications of the
findings and directions for future research are highlighted.
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Introduction

In a competitive business envi-
ronment, behavior of frontline employ-
ees play a critical role in ensuring the
success of a service provider. Being in
boundary-spanning occupations, these
employees represent the key link be-
tween the external customer and the
organization. For service-oriented
companies, the effective performance
of customer-contact workers would
directly and significantly affect cus-
tomers’ perception of the level of ser-
vice quality offered, thus creating a
losing or winning ground for the re-
lated service providers in the market
place. Customer-contact employees
who perform tasks and activities effi-
ciently which include keeping custom-
ers’ records correctly and solving cus-
tomers’ queries promptly would pro-
vide a favorable impression on the
service, thereby enhancing the image
of the service provider. Similarly, by
engaging in activities beyond their for-
mal role prescriptions such as assisting
their colleagues that are temporarily
burdened with work, providing infor-
mal mentoring for lesser skilled staffs,
and displaying acts of courtesy and
goodwill to customers, customer-con-
tact employees are bound to contribute
to better service. According to Wang
et al. (2003), superior service quality
will have positive consequences in the
form of enhanced reputation, higher
customer satisfaction and retention, and
greater profitability for the service or-
ganization.

Historically, Katz (1964) has iden-
tified two basic types of behaviors that
are necessary for organizational effec-
tiveness in the form of in-role and
extra-role job behaviors. In-role be-
havior reflects predictable job perfor-
mance responsibilities that must be
carried out in order to implement the
organization’s essential operations. If
employees fail to perform these re-
quired behaviors, they do not receive
organizational rewards and they may
lose their jobs. These types of behav-
iors are synonymous with task perfor-
mance (Borman and Motowidlo 1997)
or in-role behaviors (Bott et al. 2003;
Williams and Anderson 1991). On the
other hand, extra-role behavior reflects
variable patterns of behaviors that fall
outside of one’s job descriptions yet
facilitate the accomplishments of or-
ganizational goals (Katz 1964). These
behaviors are not assigned by the orga-
nization and thus, are voluntary in na-
ture. Employees are not punished for
not performing these acts and neither
are they rewarded for doing it. Never-
theless, these behaviors are equally
important because they allow for the
smooth internal operations of the orga-
nization which enables it to adapt to
the changing external environments.
Acts and gestures of altruism, coop-
eration, goodwill, courtesy, sportsman-
ship, and other instances help reduce
the friction encountered in work situa-
tions and under many unforeseen cir-
cumstances. Such behaviors reflect Van
Scotter’s (2000) conceptualization of
contextual performance. To sum up,
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viewing job performance that is com-
prised of two dimensions is in tandem
with those of other scholars (for in-
stance, Campbell 1990; Conway 1999).
In the customer-organization interface,
frontline, customer-contact employees
are expected to exhibit high levels of
both task and contextual performance.

A review of literature illustrated a
vast array of determinants of task per-
formance and contextual performance
using samples which have been prima-
rily derived from developed countries
especially those in the West. The in-
vestigations that focused on task per-
formance as the dependent variables
include those of Langhorn’s (2004),
Morgeson, Delaney-Klinger, and
Hemingway’s (2005), and Williams’s
(1999). Meanwhile, studies on contex-
tual performance include those by Farh
et al. (1990), Konovsky and Pugh
(1994), and Yoon and Suh (2003).
Generally, the antecedents of either
task performance or contextual perfor-
mance can be grouped under organiza-
tional, job/role, and individual-related
categories. Organizational-related pre-
dictors comprise of organizational jus-
tice (Jin and Shu 2004; Konovsky and
Pugh 1994; Konovsky and Organ 1996;
Niehoff and Moorman 1993), organi-
zational commitment (Chen and
Francesco 2003; MacKenzie et al.
1998; Moorman et al. 1993), leader-
ship (Netemeyer et al. 1997; Podsakoff
et al. 1996), perceived organizational
support (Farh et al. 1990; Kaufman et
al. 2001), and trust (Aryee et al. 2002;
Konovsky and Pugh 1994). Job/role-
related factors include job satisfaction

(Bateman and Organ 1983; MacKenzie
et al. 1998; Moorman 1993), job scope
(Farh et al. 1990; Morgeson et al. 2005),
job characteristics and burnout (Bakker
et al. 2004), and role stressors (Fried et
al. 1998; MacKenzie et al. 1998). De-
mographic variables (Pelled et al. 2000;
Tang and Ibrahim 1998; Van Emmerik
and Sanders 2004), personality traits
(Bott et al. 2003; Williams and Sanchez
1998), and emotional intelligence
(Carmeli 2003; Langhorn 2004) con-
stitute the individual-related predic-
tors. Research on the topic of job per-
formance using Malaysian subjects has
received little empirical attention. The
few studies identified have exclusively
concentrated on one particular type of
job performance, that is, extra-role citi-
zenship behavior (Hemdi et al. 2007;
Ishak et al. 2003; Nasurdin and
Ramayah 2003). Despite the extensive
literature, except for the work by
MacKenzie et al. (1998), no other stud-
ies have examined the predictors of
both forms of performance (task per-
formance and contextual performance)
simultaneously. Hence, testing a bi-
dimensional model of job performance
using a sample of employees in Malay-
sia would be helpful in addressing the
under-representation of samples from
developing countries in the East.

 Among the numerous anteced-
ents of individual job performance,
fairness perceptions have been re-
garded as important factors that affect
employees’ actions and reactions at
the workplace (Masterson et al. 2000;
Podsakoff et al. 2000). Research into
organizational justice has shown that it
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is comprised of two major compo-
nents: distributive justice and proce-
dural justice (Greenberg 1990). Al-
though numerous studies have been
conducted between organizational jus-
tice (distributive justice and procedural
justice) and work attitudes and behav-
iors (Folger and Konovsky 1989;
Konovsky and Pugh 1994; Moorman
1991; Niehoff and Moorman 1993;
Tang and Sarsfield-Baldwin 1996;
Williams 1999; Kwon 2006), the rela-
tive importance of these two dimen-
sions in explaining the variance in the
criterion variables has yet to be clearly
demonstrated. Hence, the goal of the
present investigation is to examine the
influence of organizational justice (dis-
tributive justice and procedural jus-
tice) on both forms of job performance
(task performance and contextual per-
formance) among customer-contact
employees in Malaysia.

Review of Literature

Job Performance

The meaning of job performance
in the field of organizational behavior
has changed over the last few decades.
There has been a growing realization
that job performance is not a unitary
construct. In fact, researches have
shifted from a focus on fixed tasks
associated with the jobs to encompass
a broader perspective in a dynamic
organizational context (Ilgen and
Hollenbeck 1991). Traditionally, per-
formance was evaluated in terms of the
proficiency with which an individual

carried out the tasks that were pre-
scribed in his or her role descriptions
(Griffin et al. 2007). This con-
ceptualization is in tandem with those
of earlier scholars (such as Katz 1964;
Katz and Kahn 1978). According to
these authors, for an organization to
function, its members must be able to
exhibit dependable role performance,
i.e. meet and preferably exceed certain
minimal standards. Such role-pre-
scribed work behaviors reflect task
performance. According to Motowidlo
and Van Scotter (1994), task perfor-
mance comprises two types of behav-
iors. The first type consists of activi-
ties which directly transform raw ma-
terials into the goods and services which
the organization produces. The second
type comprises of activities that ser-
vice and maintains the technical core.
In other words, when employees use
technical skills and knowledge to pro-
duce goods or services through the
organization’s core technical pro-
cesses, or when they accomplish spe-
cialized tasks that support these core
functions, they are engaging in task
performance (Van Scotter 2000).

The increasing interdependence
and uncertainty associated with work
and organizations have challenged the
traditional views of individual job per-
formance (Ilgen and Pulakos 1999).
Although early approaches to job per-
formance have highlighted the need
for organizational members to
innovatively and spontaneously go
beyond prescribed roles to accomplish
organizational goals (Katz 1964; Katz
and Kahn 1978), the full range of be-
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haviors that contribute to effective-
ness when systems are uncertain and
interdependent are not adequately
emphasized (Murphy and Jackson
1999). Uncertainty in an organizational
context occurs when the inputs, pro-
cesses, or outputs of work systems
lack predictability (Wall et al. 2002).
According to Burns and Stalker (1961),
the existence of uncertainty in the work
environment may be attributed to many
factors such as increasing competi-
tion, changing technology, and evolv-
ing customer demands. When the or-
ganizational context is more dynamic,
it becomes more difficult for task per-
formance alone to be effective. In such
situation, there is greater need for role
flexibility whereby employees are re-
quired to engage in adaptive and pro-
active behaviors. Hence, new con-
structs have emerged that encompass
an expanded set of duties and respon-
sibilities. One of such constructs re-
lates to contextual performance, which
includes a variety of non-job specific
behaviors (Borman and Motowidlo
1993). When employees voluntarily
help coworkers who are getting be-
hind, act in ways that maintain good
working relationships, or put in extra
effort to complete assignment on time,
they are engaging in contextual perfor-
mance (Van Scotter 2000). In sum,
contextual performance behaviors do
not support the technical core itself as
much as they support the broader orga-
nizational, social and psychological
environment in which the technical
core must function (Motowidlo 2000).

Therefore, any measure of perfor-
mance should capture all aspects of
behaviors that have value for the orga-
nization. Consistent with this principle,
dissection of the performance domain
into task performance and contextual
performance is important. Furthermore,
as previously noted by scholars (Bott
et al. 2003; MacKenzie et al. 1998;
Motowidlo and Van Scotter 1994; Van
Emmerik and Sanders 2004), each of
the performance dimensions is associ-
ated with a different set of antecedents.

Organizational Justice and Job
Performance

Two sources of organizational jus-
tice have been frequently cited in the
literature: distributive justice and pro-
cedural justice (Moorman 1991). Dis-
tributive justice refers to the perceived
fairness of the amounts of outcomes
employees receive (Greenberg 1990).
Procedural justice, on the other hand,
reflects a person’s judgments about
the fairness of the process of making
outcome allocations decisions
(Greenberg 1990). Specifically, pro-
cedural justice relates to the extent in
which an individual perceives that out-
come allocation decisions have been
fairly made according to the
organization’s formal procedures and
from the treatments given by the
organization’s authorities in enacting
those procedures (Moorman 1991).
Generally, prior researchers (Jin and
Shu 2004; Moorman 1991; Niehoff
and Moorman 1993; Williams 1999)
conclude that both types of justice in-
fluence employees’ job behaviors.
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Distributive Justice and Job
Performance

Distributive justice is defined as
the perceived fairness of the amounts
of outcomes employees receives
(Greenberg 1990). Basically, it reflects
how significant rewards (such as com-
pensation) from organized organiza-
tional efforts are fairly distributed
among employees (Farh et al. 1990;
Folger and Konovsky 1989). The posi-
tive relationship between distributive
justice and performance may be due to
the predictions derived from Adam’s
(1965) equity theory. The theory pos-
its that human motivation is affected
by the outcomes people receive for
their inputs, compared to the outcomes
and inputs of other people (Pierce and
Gardner 2002). When employees feel
that they are being treated unequally,
they will restore equity by altering
their behaviors, attitudes, or both such
as to be less productive or vice-versa
(Greenberg 1990). In other words,
unfair distribution of work rewards
relative to work inputs creates tension
within an individual, which may ulti-
mately results in a reduction in work
inputs. Based on Blau’s (1964) eco-
nomic exchange, distributive justice
may results in an increased exhibition
of in-role task behavior. On the other
hand, when employees define their
employment relationships as that of a
social one, contextual performance
may be deemed as an appropriate re-
sponse to distributive fairness. Find-
ings from past studies in the West have
been divided. Some studies (Moorman

1991; Niehoff and Moorman 1993)
find that when two types of justice
were measured separately, procedural
justice predicts citizenship behaviors
but not distributive justice. In contrast,
Williams (1999) using an experimen-
tal design discovers that distributive
justice perceptions are significantly and
positively related to task performance.
Given the paucity of research on the
justice-performance relationship in
Eastern societies, testing a model link-
ing these variables using a sample of
Malaysian employees will be able to
address this issue. We expect that there
will be similarity in the findings on the
positive effect of distributive justice
on individual performance as discov-
ered by Western scholars. Therefore,
this study posits that:

H 
1
: Distributive justice will be posi-
tively related to job performance.

H 
1a

: Distributive justice will be
positively related to task per-
formance.

H 
1b

: Distributive justice will be
positively related to contex-
tual performance.

Procedural Justice and Job
Performance

Procedural justice is defined as a
person’s judgments about the fairness
of the process of making outcome allo-
cations decisions (Greenberg 1990).
Specifically, procedural justice reflects
the extent in which an individual per-
ceives that outcome allocation deci-
sions have been fairly made according
to the organization’s formal procedures
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and from the treatment given by the
organization’s authorities in enacting
those procedures (Moorman 1991).
Since process issues are equally im-
portant to people whenever allocations
are made (Tyler 1987), it is highly
likely that procedural justice may have
a potent effect on employees’ job per-
formance. Organ (1990) opines that
perceived procedural fairness alters an
employee’s relationship with the orga-
nization from one of economic ex-
change to one of social exchange. In
social exchange relationships (Blau
1964), when employees are satisfied
with the fairness of procedures, they
are more likely to reciprocate by en-
gaging in discretionary behaviors that
lie outside of their formal role require-
ments. These extra-role behaviors re-
late to contextual performance. Be-
sides, procedural justice is comprised
of fair procedures, which include ac-
tions such as allowing employees a
voice in the decision process, and fair
treatment, which is comprised of ac-
tions such as providing employees with
information justifying the outcome they
receive, are thought to increase the
probability that the distribution of out-
comes will be fair (Williams 1999). As
a result, employees will be more likely
to feel satisfied, and subsequently per-
form their duties as specified in their
job descriptions. Some studies (Jin and
Shu 2004; Williams 1999) support the
positive relationship between proce-
dural justice judgments and task per-
formance. Others also provide empiri-
cal evidence for the positive impact of
procedural justice on contextual per-

formance (Jin and Shu 2004; Konovsky
and Pugh 1994; Konovsky and Organ
1996; Nasurdin and Ramayah 2003).
Based on the aforementioned discus-
sion and findings, it appears that em-
ployees’ experience of procedural jus-
tice may lead to increased performance.
Therefore, the following hypothesis is
offered:

H 
2
: Procedural justice will be posi-

tively related to job performance.

H 
2a

: Procedural justice will be
positively related to task
performance.

H 
2b

: Procedural justice will be
positively related to con-
textual performance.

Methodology

Subjects

Participants in the study were cus-
tomer-contact employees working in
the northern and central branches of a
telecommunication company in Ma-
laysia. The northern region covering
the 10 branches in the states of Penang,
Perlis, Kedah, and Perak had 107 cus-
tomer-contact employees. On the other
hand, the central region comprising of
14 branches in Kuala Lumpur and
Selangor had 160 customer-contact
employees. Questionnaires were dis-
tributed and subsequently collected
from these 267 employees with the
help of the northern and central re-
gional managers. Respondents were
given two weeks to answer the ques-
tionnaires.
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Measurement

The predictor variables in this
study are distributive justice and pro-
cedural justice. The criterion variables
are task performance and contextual
performance. Distributive justice was
assessed using 3 items adapted from
Moorman (1991). Procedural justice
was gauged using 6 items adapted from
Niehoff and Moorman (1993). Re-
sponses to these items were made on a
5-point scale (1= strongly disagree to
5= strongly agree). The criterion vari-
ables relate to the two forms of job
performance namely task performance
and contextual performance. These two
variables were assessed via supervi-
sory ratings. Seven items were used to
measure task performance adopted
from Williams and Anderson (1991).
Another eight items were utilized to
gauge contextual performance adapted
from Hochwarter et al. (2004). Re-
sponses to the items were made on a 5-
point scale (1= strongly disagree to 5=
strongly agree).

Method of Analysis

Since gender, age, race, job ten-
ure, and organizational tenure have
been found to be related to job perfor-
mance (Bott et al. 2003; Chen and
Francesco 2003; Jones and
Schaubroeck 2004; Hochwarter et al.
2004; Williams et al. 2002), these per-
sonal variables were controlled in the
statistical analyses. Data was initially
factor analyzed using the criteria de-

veloped by Igbaria, Iivaria, and
Maragahh (1995). All items conform
to the original factors. In the present
study, the two hypotheses were tested
using hierarchical regression follow-
ing Cohen and Cohen’s (1975) recom-
mendation.

Results

Profile of Respondents

In all, 136 useable questionnaires
were returned and analyzed represent-
ing a response rate of 50.94 percent. A
total of 34 superiors were involved in
assessing the job performance of the
participating customer-contact em-
ployees. The demographic profile of
the sample is shown in Table 1.

From Table 1, of those who com-
pleted the survey, 54 (39.7%) were
males and 82 (60.3%) were females. In
terms of marital status, 86 respondents
were married (63.2%) and 50 were
unmarried (36.8%). For ethnicity, 80
respondents were Malays (58.8%), 40
respondents were Chinese (29.4%),
with the remaining 16 respondents
(11.7%) being Indians and others. Re-
garding education, a majority of the
sample (59.5%) have polytechnic/col-
lege certificates and diplomas. The
mean age for the sample was 27.32
years (SD= 3.53 years). The mean job
tenure and organizational tenure were
3.40 years (SD= 1.89 years) and 3.75
years (SD= 1.98 years) respectively.



343

Nasurdin & Khuan—Organizational Justice as an Antecedent of Job Performance

Mean, Standard Deviations, and
Correlations of the Study
Variables

Descriptive statistics such as mean
scores, standard deviations,
reliabilities, and intercorrelations of
the study variables are presented in
Table 2.

As depicted in Table 2, on the
average, the levels of procedural jus-
tice and distributive justice were judged
to be within the moderate to slightly
high range. On further scrutiny, re-

spondents in this study perceived the
level of distributive justice (mean=
4.13, SD=1.02) to be higher than that
of procedural justice (mean= 3.72, SD=
0.89). The mean values for task perfor-
mance and contextual performance
were 3.80 (SD= 1.03) and 3.88 (SD=
0.68) respectively. On average, the
levels of task performance and contex-
tual performance exhibited by the
sample were relatively moderate.

The reliability coefficients for the
study variables were above 0.9 which
concur with Nunnally’s (1978) mini-

Table 1. Demographic Profile of Sample

Demographic Variable Categories Frequency Percentage (%)

Gender Male 54 39.7

Female 82 60.3

Marital Status Unmarried 50 36.8

Married 86 60.3

Ethnicity Malays 80 58.8

Chinese 40 29.4

Indians and others 16 11.7

Education Secondary School
Certificates 55 40.4

Polytechnic and
College Certificates 35 25.7

Diploma 46 33.8

Mean Standard Deviation

Age (years) 27.32 3.53

Job Tenure (years) 3.40 1.89

Organizational Tenure (years) 3.75 1.98
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Table 2. Descriptive Statistics, Correlations, and Reliabilities of the Study
Variables

Variable Mean SD DJ PJ TP CP

DJ 4.13 1.02 (0.94)
PJ 3.72 0.89 -0.136 (0.92)
TP 3.80 1.03 0.514 ** 0.022 (0.95)
 CP 3.88 0.68 -0.052 0.375 ** 0.517 ** (0.94)

** p < 0.01, * p < 0.05
Note: Values in parentheses on the diagonal indicate reliability coefficients; DJ denotes

Distributive Justice, PJ denotes Procedural Justice, TP denotes Task Performance,
and CP denotes Contextual Performance.

Table 3. Results of Regression Analysis: Impact of DJ and PJ on TP

Independent Variables Task Performance (TP)

Std Beta (Model 1) Std Beta(Model 2)

Control Variables

Age 0.082 0.014

Job Tenure 0.099 0.133

Organizational Tenure -0.237 -0.219

Gender (Male=1, Female= 0) 0.163 0.078

Race 1 (Malay=1,Others= 0) 0.135 0.149

Race 2 (Chinese=1, Others= 0) 0.079 0.100

Model Variables

Distributive Justice 0.513 **

Procedural Justice 0.083

R2 0.063 0.309

Adj. R2 0.019 0.265

R2- Change 0.063 0.246

F-Change 1.444 22.603 **

**p < 0.01, *p < 0.05

mum required level of 0.70. These
high alpha values indicate that the
measurements used were reliable. In
terms of the correlation values, dis-

tributive justice had significant and
positive associations with task perfor-
mance (r= 0.514, p<.01) and proce-
dural justice had a significant and posi-
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tive association with contextual per-
formance (r= 0.375, p<.01). Besides,
the correlation coefficient between task
performance and contextual perfor-
mance was significant and positive
(r= 0.517, p<.01). Other correlations
were found to be insignificant.

Hypotheses Testing

The two dimensions of organiza-
tional justice (distributive justice and
procedural justice) were regressed on
to the two dimensions of performance
(task performance and contextual per-
formance) separately. Table 3 reports
the results of regressing distributive
justice (DJ) and procedural justice (PJ)
on task performance (TP).

As reflected in Table 3, control
variables were able to explain 6.3 per-
cent of the variance in task perfor-
mance (R2= 0.063). None of the con-
trol variables was found to be related to
task performance. The F-change
(1.444) was also insignificant. When
the two model variables comprising of
distributive justice and procedural jus-
tice were added into the regression
equation, the additional variance ex-
plained was 24.6 percent (R2-Change=
0.246, F-change= 22.603, p < .01). In
the second model, distributive justice
(â= 0.513, p < .01) alone had a signifi-
cant and positive effect on task perfor-
mance. Procedural justice, on the other
hand, had no effect on task perfor-

Table 4. Results of Regression Analysis: Impact of DJ and PJ on CP

Independent Variables Contextual Performance (CP)

Std Beta (Model 1) Std Beta(Model 2)

Control Variables
Age -0.177 -0.192
Job Tenure 0.037 0.009
Organizational Tenure -0.007 0.001
Gender (Male=1, Female= 0) 0.042 0.013
Race 1 (Malay=1,Others= 0) 0.103 0.080
Race 2 (Chinese=1, Other= 0) 0.146 0.102

Model Variables
Distributive Justice 0.020
Procedural Justice 0.385 **

R2 0.034 0.178
Adj. R2 -0.010 0.127
R2- Change 0.034 0.144
F-Change 0.768 11.114 **

**p < 0.01, *p < 0.05
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mance. This finding provided support
for H

1a
 but not H

2a
.

Table 4 displays the results of
regressing distributive justice (DJ) and
procedural justice (PJ) on contextual
performance. Results in Table  show
that control variables in the combina-
tion were able to explain 3.4 percent of
the variance in contextual performance
(R2= 0.034). None of them was signifi-
cantly related to contextual perfor-
mance. The F-change (0.768) was also
insignificant. When the two model
variables were added into the regres-
sion equation, the additional variance
explained was 14.4 percent (R2-
Change= 0.144, F-change= 11.114, p
< .01). In the second model, only pro-
cedural justice (â= 0.385, p < .01) was
found to have a significant and posi-
tive effect on contextual performance.
Distributive justice, on the other hand,
had no effect on contextual perfor-
mance. This finding provided support
for H

2b
 but not

 
H

1b

Discussion, Implication, and
Limitations

The objective of the current study
is to examine whether organizational
justice dimensions (distributive jus-
tice and procedural justice) have posi-
tive effects on job performance. The
statistical results indicated that the two
organizational justice dimensions have
separate effects on the two forms of
performance. In this study, only dis-
tributive justice and task performance
is found to be positively related. This
finding supports those of Williams’s

(1999). When employees define their
employment relationships as that of an
economic exchange (Blau 1964), they
are likely to fulfill their formal em-
ployment contract by engaging in in-
role behaviors (task performance). In
line with the arguments put forth by
past scholars (Moorman 1991; Niehoff
and Moorman 1993), judgments about
the existence of fairness of the ends
achieved will foster a state of equity,
creating feelings of satisfaction, and
resulting in the display of functional
behaviors aimed at fulfilling the for-
mal contract of employment. Besides,
the respondents in this study were blue-
collar, customer-contact Malaysian
employees, whose nature of tasks sug-
gest the primacy of productivity goal.
According to Meindl (1989), the eq-
uity rule is preferred when the task
goal relates to productivity. Thus,
perceptions of fairness in the reward
allocations received may well be more
salient as a commodity for economic
exchange. In other words, when these
workers judged their rewards to be
equitable, they are likely to recipro-
cate by engaging in role-prescribed
behaviors.

Procedural justice, however, failed
to have any effect on task performance.
One probable explanation could be
due to the position held by the respon-
dents. In a service setting, customer-
contact employees may not be in a
position to judge the prevalence of
procedural fairness. The need to handle
customers’ queries and problems on
an on-going basis would not have en-
abled them to have the time to retrieve
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information concerning the processes
and procedures used in determining
their allocation outcomes.

In contrast, procedural justice
alone was found to have a significant
and positive effect on contextual per-
formance. This finding is consistent
with those of past scholars (Jin and
Shu, 2004; Konovsky and Pugh 1994;
Konovsky and Organ 1996; Nasurdin
and Ramayah 2003; Niehoff and
Moorman 1993). When employees
define their employment relationships
as that of social exchange (Blau 1964),
they are likely to reciprocate by engag-
ing in discretionary, extra-role behav-
iors. In tandem with the group-value
model (Lind and Tyler 1988), the use
of fair procedures and processes help
communicate the fact that the employee
is a valued member of the group. Such
impressions may motivate the em-
ployee to behave in a manner that will
ensure the welfare of the group. Con-
textual performance is an example of
such behaviors. Besides, people from
collectivistic cultures are more con-
cerned for interpersonal harmony and
group solidarity (Leung 1988). Hence,
they are more inclined to place higher
importance on the process of making
outcome allocation decisions espe-
cially the interpersonal facets of pro-
cedural justice (Greenberg 2001). Since
Malaysia is more of a collectivistic
society (Hofstede 1991), perceived
procedural fairness may well serve as
a key commodity for social exchange.
In other words, when these workers
judged the process of determining their
rewards to be equitable, they are likely

to reciprocate by engaging in extra-
role contextual behaviors.

On the other hand, distributive
justice failed to have any effect on
contextual performance. One possible
reason may be related to the sample
itself. A majority of the Malaysian
customer-contact employees surveyed
were women (60.3%) and married
(63.2%). In countries of the East such
as Malaysia, as noted by Mansor
(1994), married women are expected
to place more attention towards family
matters than their jobs or careers. This
is in line with the traditional values
associated with women as homemak-
ers. According to Gutek, Searle, and
Klepa (1991), women are expected to
provide a stable home situation rather
than financial security. Hence, even
though these female workers may judge
the outcomes that they have received
as fair, they may not be able to spend
their time and effort in reciprocating
their employers by performing beyond
their in-role job requirements.

The strongest implication of this
study is that fairness is an important
motivator of job performance at the
workplace. In order to enhance em-
ployees’ task performance, managers
as representatives of the employing
organization should ensure that the
outcomes employees received are fair.
A key aspect to consider is to reward
workers based on objective criteria
and merit. Similarly, managers who
wish to see an improvement in the
contextual performance of their em-
ployees must treat them fairly and make
use of fair procedures when making
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outcomes allocation decisions. Among
others, managers need to apply rules
fairly and consistently, treat employ-
ees with respect and dignity, make job
decisions in an unbiased manner, col-
lect accurate and complete informa-
tion before making job decisions, and
show sensitivity towards employees’
personal needs.

Finally, the reader is cautioned to
recognize the limitations of this study.
First, all participants were customer-
contact employees within the telecom-
munication industry which may be
associated with certain unique features.
Thus, the findings obtained may not be
generalized to other samples across
different industries. The use of a larger

sample from diverse sectors would
make it easier to generalize the find-
ings. Second, both forms of justice
(procedural justice and distributive
justice) accounts for about 24.6 per-
cent and 14.4 percent of the variance in
task performance and contextual per-
formance respectively. Although these
figures are somewhat acceptable, the
amount of unexplained variance in job
performance is still substantial. This
should encourage future researchers to
expend their efforts towards identify-
ing other variables that may be able to
explain job performance, which in-
clude those related to the organization,
job, and individual.
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